
UNITED STATES DEPARTMENT OF JUSTICE 

EXECUTIVE OFFICE FOR IMMIGRATION REVIEW 

MEMPHIS IMMIGRATION COURT 

STANDING ORDER: PROCEDURES 

On March 17, 2020, the Federal Government issued a memorandum directing agencies to minimize face-to-face 
interactions with members of the public, which is posted at https://www.whitehouse.gov/wp­
content/uploads/2020/03/M-20-16.pdf. To comply with directives from Federal, State, and County health 
officials and reduce the spread of COVID-19, it is hereby ordered that the following procedures shall be 
implemented immediately in the Memphis Immigration Court and shall remain effective until rescinded by a 
superseding order of the Memphis Immigration Court. This order is made pursuant to Immigration and 
Nationality Act§ 240(b)(l)-(2) and 8 C.F.R. § 1003.l0(b), 1003.21(b), 1003.25, 1003.29, 1003.3 l(c), 1003.40. 

All parties should continue to monitor the EOIR website at https://www.justice.gov/eoir and/or EOIR's Twitter 
feed at: @DOJ _ EOIR (https://twitter.com/doi eoir?lang=en) for the latest information on court operating status. 

INDIVIDUALS WITH COVID-19 SYMPTOMS OR POSITIVE COVID-19 TEST 

Under no circumstances shall any individual experiencing symptoms consistent with COVID-19 infection enter 
the Court, including but not limited to the lobby, filing window, and courtrooms. This same restriction applies 
to any individuals who have tested positive for COVID-19, unless they have been affirmatively advised by an 
appropriate medical professional that they are no longer contagious. If any individual described in this 
paragraph is unable to attend an upcoming hearing at which his or her presence is required, he or she shall 
promptly notify the Court in writing to the Court's email filing mailbox at 
Memphis.lmmigration.Court@usdoj.gov, or in an emergency, by telephone to the Court. 

FILING OF MOTIONS, APPLICATIONS, BRIEFS, EVIDENCE, AND OTHER DOCUMENTS 

Routine Filings: First class mail, express delivery services, or email sent in compliance with the guidelines 
posted at https://www.justice.gov/eoir/filing-email are strongly preferred over in-person submission of motions, 
applications, briefs, evidence, and any other documents. However, filings to the Court's email filing mailbox 
should not be made more than three (3) months in advance of any filing deadline or hearing date unless it is an 

application for asylum and its filing is necessary to meet the one-year filing requirement of Section 
208(a)(2)(B). Additionally, any submissions over fifty (50) pages must be made by means other than email. 

Time-Sensitive Filings: All filing deadlines ordered by the Court remain in effect. Unless otherwise ordered by 
the Court, all filings are due in accordance with the deadlines established in the Immigration Court Practice 
Manual, Chapter 3.l(b). Untimely filings are subject to the consequences identified in the Immigration Court 
Practice Manual, Chapter 3 .1 ( d). 

Page Limit: For documents relating to country conditions or other reference materials, a maximum of 150 pages 
may be submitted. The relevance of each background/country condition document shall be set forth in the table 
of contents or by citation in the prehearing statement. A party wishing to submit more than 150 pages of such 
documentation must first establish good cause in a written motion that identifies the documents sought to be 
submitted, why they are believed to be necessary, and what they show that is not already established by any 
prior submissions. The U.S. Department of State's most recent Country Report on Human Rights Practices and 
Report on International Religious Freedom may be submitted, or made part of the record by motion, without 
counting against this page limit. 


























