From: Bridget Kelly <Bridget.Kelly@gov.state.nj.us>

Sent: Tuesday, June 04, 2013 1:53 PM
To: Wildstein, David
Subject: RE: Fort Lee Agreement

Right. Well, either way, no rush.

From: Wildstein, David [mailto:dwildstein@panynj.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, June 04, 2013 1:46 PM

To: Bridget Kelly

Subject: RE: Fort Lee Agreement

Unless Halloween comes before that.

From: Bridget Kelly [mailto:Bridget.Kelly@gov.state.nj.us]
Sent: Tuesday, June 04, 2013 1:44 PM

To: Wildstein, David

Subject: RE: Fort Lee Agreement

[t will not snow until at least late November.

From: Wildstein, David [mailto:dwildstein@panynj.gov]
Sent: Tuesday, June 04, 2013 12:37 PM

To: Bridget Kelly

Subject: FW: Fort Lee Agreement

From: Eastman, Karen

Sent: Tuesday, June 04, 2013 12:37 PM
To: Wildstein, David

Subject: Fort Lee Agreement

Are you ok with the attached MJ for a renewal of the agreement with Fort Lee for road cleaning and snow
removal on behalf of the PA on seven streets in Fort Lee near the GWB. This is a renewal to a prior 5-year
contract, which was put in place in 2007. The proposed 5-year agreement provides for PA payment of
$350,000. | have attached the prior letter agreement, which also provided for $350,000 payment by the PA.

Please advise.
GOVERNMENT
Karen EXH'B'T
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NOTICE: THIS E-MAIL AND ANY ATTACHMENTS CONTAIN INFORMATION FROM THE PORT
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AUTHORITY OF NEW YORK AND NEW JERSEY AND AFFILIATES. 1F YOU BELIEVE YOU HAVE
RECEIVED THIS E-MAIL IN ERROR, PLEASE NOTIFY THE SENDER IMMEDIATELY,
PERMANENTLY DELETE THIS E-MAIL (ALONG WITH ANY ATTACHMENTS), AND DESTROY ANY

PRINTOUTS.
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